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From the Ishango Bone of central Africa and the Inca quipu of South America to the dawn of modern
mathematics, The Crest of the Peacock makes it clear that human beings everywhere have been capable of
advanced and innovative mathematical thinking. George Gheverghese Joseph takes us on a breathtaking
multicultural tour of the roots and shoots of non-European mathematics. He shows us the deep influence that
the Egyptians and Babylonians had on the Greeks, the Arabs' major creative contributions, and the
astounding range of successes of the great civilizations of India and China.

The third edition emphasizes the dialogue between civilizations, and further explores how mathematical
ideas were transmitted from East to West. The book's scope is now even wider, incorporating recent findings
on the history of mathematics in China, India, and early Islamic civilizations as well as Egypt and
Mesopotamia. With more detailed coverage of proto-mathematics and the origins of trigonometry and
infinity in the East, The Crest of the Peacock further illuminates the global history of mathematics.
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From reader reviews:

Terry Sugg:

The book The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of Mathematics can give more knowledge and also
the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book
The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of Mathematics? Several of you have a different opinion
about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to
closer along with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you could give for each other;
it is possible to share all of these. Book The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of Mathematics has
simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous
world by open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Leo Rizer:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this particular The Crest of the Peacock: Non-
European Roots of Mathematics book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Harold Houston:

Here thing why this specific The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of Mathematics are different
and trusted to be yours. First of all reading a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer
which is the content is as yummy as food or not. The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of
Mathematics giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any book out there but there is
no publication that similar with The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of Mathematics. It gives you
thrill reading through journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing in which happened in the world
which is might be can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in park your car,
café, or even in your method home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the imprinted
book maybe the form of The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of Mathematics in e-book can be
your alternate.

Marilyn Calhoun:

Why? Because this The Crest of the Peacock: Non-European Roots of Mathematics is an unordinary book
that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who write the book in such incredible way makes the
content within easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is



good for you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give
you a lot of rewards than the other book have such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking
technique. So , still want to delay having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.
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